
BID OPENING 
December 6, 2005 

File #5,6,7,9,10,11,12,13,14,15,16,17,20,21,22 
Milton, Florida 

 
Present:  Procurement Officer; Office Assistant II; Ralph Hayes II representing Hayes 
Construction, Inc.; Peter Behety representing Behety Hayes Construction; Samuel Hayes 
representing Behety Hayes Construction; Bryan Thurman representing Thurman 
Construction; Gary Thurman representing Thurman Construction; James Haney 
representing GAC Contractors; Paula Hering representing Deep & Wide Dredging; 
Jennifer Beasley representing A.E.New Jr., Inc.; Josh McNeely representing Thompson 
Trailer; Chris Hering representing Deep & Wide Dredging; John Frank representing 
Beard Equipment Co.; David Yorman representing Caldwell Associates; David Thomas 
representing Caldwell Associates; Scott Markel representing Santa Rosa County EMC; 
Joe Windrow representing Orville Beckord; Steve Moore representing Coastal Reef 
Builders; Tom Garner representing Speegle Construction; Richard Hall representing 
Larry Hall Construction; and Michael Schmidt representing Santa Rosa County 
Engineering.       The meeting took place at 10:00 a.m. 
 
The purpose of the meeting was to open bids for Pace Regional Library, Communications 
Equipment Building, Hickory Shores Seawall, Sale of Property-27 acres, Track Type 
Tractor w/ Waste Handling Package, Vehicles, Emergency Watershed Protection–
Dickerson Avenue, Emergency Watershed Protection–Settlers Colony, Emergency 
Watershed Protection –Sandy Beach, Emergency Watershed Protection–Soundside 
Drive, Emergency Watershed Protection–Cedar Street, Emergency Watershed 
Protection–Valley Road, Emergency Watershed Protection–Turkey Bluff; and quotes for 
Engineering Services SRC Environmental Services; and proposals for Lobbying 
Services. Bids, quotes, and proposals were received from the following: 
 
  Pace Regional Library: 
  1.  Speegle Construction, Inc.   $1,107,000.00 
  2.  Larry Hall Construction, Inc.   $1,175,000.00 
  3.  GAC Contractors, Inc.    $1,192,568.00 
  4.  A. E. New, Jr., Inc.    $1,316,000.00 
 
  Communication Equipment Building: 
  1.  Fibrebond Corporation    $74,055.00  w/o foundation 
  2.  Thermo Bond Buildings, Inc.   $79,836.00  w/o foundation  
       $88,796.00  with foundation 
  3.  CSI Shelter Technologies   $95,796.00  w/o foundation 
  4.  Concrete Modular Systems, Inc.   $98,723.03  w/o foundation 
 
  Hickory Shores Seawall:     
  1.  Deep & Wide Dredging    $41,900.00 
  2.  Coastal Reef Builders, Inc.   $69,685.00  
 



  Sale of Property -27 acres: 
  1.  Project BC     $5,760.00 per acre 
 
  Track Type Tractor w/ Waste Handling Package: 
  1.  Tractor & Equipment Company    $220,950.00 
  2.  Beard Equipment      $221,952.39 
  3.  Thompson Tractor Company    $252,795.00 
  4.  Equipment, Inc.      No-Bid 
  5.  Mattman Specialty Vehicles    No-Bid 
  6.  ASC Construction Equipment    No-Bid 
  7.  Ingram Equipment Company, LLC   No-Bid 
  8.  Advanced Striping Equipment, Inc.   No-Bid 
 
  Vehicles: 
  1.  Tropical Ford   

4 WD Sport Utility Vehicle    $23,278.00 
4 WD Sport Utility Vehicle w/ Towing Package $23,576.00 
½ Ton Pickup Trucks     $12,250.00 
½ Ton 4 WD Pickup Trucks    $15,123.00 
Compact Pickup Trucks w/ Extended Cab  $12,269.00 
4 WD Compact Pickup Truck w/ Extended Cab $15,684.00 
15 Passenger Vans w/ Towing Package  $18,392.00 
Cargo Van      $13,352.00 
9200 lb GVWR Pickup Truck    $20,205.00 
9200 lb GVWR Crew-Cab Pickup Truck  $23,215.00 

 
2.  Orville Beckford Ford/ Mercury   

4 WD Sport Utility Vehicle    $23,900.00 
4 WD Sport Utility Vehicle w/ Towing Package $24,200.00 
½ Ton Pickup Trucks     $11,980.00 
½ Ton 4 WD Pickup Trucks    $15,590.00 
Compact Pickup Trucks w/ Extended Cab  $12,207.00 
4 WD Compact Pickup Truck w/ Extended Cab $15,615.00 
15 Passenger Vans w/ Towing Package  $18,517.00 
Cargo Van      $13,290.00 alt. $13,290.00 
9200 lb GVWR Pickup Truck    $20,770.00 
9200 lb GVWR Crew-Cab Pickup Truck  $23,760.00 
 

  3.  Ingram Equipment Company, LLC   No-Bid 
  4.  Advanced Striping Equipment, Inc.   No-Bid 
  5.  Cowin Equipment Company, Inc.   No-Bid  
 
  
 
 Emergency Watershed Protection–Dickerson Avenue: 
  1.  Hayes Construction, Inc.     $334,535.00 



  2.  Behety-Hayes Construction Company   $338,115.00 
 
  Emergency Watershed Protection–Settlers Colony: 
  1.  Thurman Construction, LLC    $132,499.00 
  2.  Behety-Hayes Construction Company   $149,800.00 
 
  Emergency Watershed Protection –Sandy Beach:  
  1.  Behety-Hayes Construction Company   $  96,840.00 
  2.  Hayes Construction, Inc.     $131,910.00 alt. $132,310.00 
       
  Emergency Watershed Protection–Soundside Drive: 
  1.  Behety-Hayes Construction Company   $198,055.00 
 
   Emergency Watershed Protection–Cedar Street:  
  1.  Thurman Construction, LLC    $298,500.00 
  2.  Hayes Construction, Inc.     $344,395.62 
  3.  Behety-Hayes Construction Company   $367,472.00 
  Emergency Watershed Protection–Valley Road: 
  1.  Behety-Hayes Construction Company   $139,385.00 
  2.  Hayes Construction, Inc.     $195,282.50 
 
  Emergency Watershed Protection–Turkey Bluff: 
  1.  Behety-Hayes Construction Company   $120,960.00 
  2.  Hayes Construction, Inc.     $128,191.00   
 
  RFQ - Engineering Services SRC Environmental Services: 
  1.  Jehle-Halstead, Inc.     Quote 
  2.  Jones Edmunds Engineers, Architects, Scientists Quote 
  3.  HDR Engineering, Inc.     Quote 
  4.  Chastain Skillman Incorporated    Quote 
  5.  SCS Engineers      Quote 
 
  RFP - Lobbying Services: 
  1.  Meridian Consulting Group    Proposal 
  2.  GMA       Proposal 
  3.  JEJ & Associates, Inc. & Snow Strategies, Inc.  Proposal 
  4.  Prieguez & Weems, LLC     Proposal 
  5.  The Advocacy Group at TEW Cardenas, LLC  Proposal 
  6.  Ronald L. Book, P.A.     Proposal 
  7.  Uhlfelder & Associates, P.A.    Proposal 
  8.  Johnson & Associates     Proposal 
  9.  Dutko Poole McKinley     Proposal 
 10. Public Affairs Consultants    Proposal 


