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L7 “*ﬁ SANTA ROSA COUNTY
ROGER BLAYLOCK, P.E., County Engineer

ENVIRONMENTAL DEPARTMENT rogerb@santarosa.fl.gov

RON HIXSON, Environmental Manager

6065 Old Bagdad Highway | Milton, Florida 32583
ronh@santarosa.fl.gov

Memo

To: Tony Gomillion, County Administrator

From: Ronald Hixson, Environmental Managerﬁ_ﬁ#
Thru: Roger Blaylock, P.E., County Engineer W"

Date: April 15,2016

Re: RENTAL OF ARTICULATED DUMP TRUCK FOR CENTRAL LANDFILL

Discussion:
The SRC Central Landfill has recently completed construction of a new MSW disposal cell. Environmental Department

staff is currently preparing to place the first 3’ layer of waste within the cell as soon as the cell is certified by FDEP, which
should be the end of April, 2016. The first layer of waste must be carefully selected to make sure there are no sharp
objects such as treated wood or pieces of metal mixed in the MSW that could potentially puncture the liner. This will
mean that for an approximate 3 month period the Landfill will have a total of three {3) working faces, (Class | Select

Loads, Class | Normal Loads, and Class Il1).

Finding:
During preparation to begin depositing select loads into the new disposal cell it was noted that the landfill only has one

articulated dumptruck, and it will not be able to handle hauling daily cover to'the Class | select load area, Class | normal
load area, the Class Ill area, and haul soil for slope maintenance. In addition, landfill staff needs to perform maintenance
on the entrance/egress road for the new cell which will involve hauling additional soil and aggregate to this road and
spreading/compacting for stabilization during heavy rain events. Environmental Department staff solicited quotes from
three (3) local companies for the monthly rental of a 25-30 ton articulated off-road dump truck (See Attached Quotes for
Comparison Shopping). Beard Equipment provided the lowest priced quote which came to $8,100.00 per month.

Actions to be Considered:

That the Board of County Commissioners (BOCC) will allow the SRC Environmental Department to rent a 25 Ton
Articulated Off Road Dump Truck from Beard Equipment for $8,100.00 per month for a total of three (3) months. The
total for all three months including delivery and pickup charges will be $24,550.00, based on comparison shopping.




11/1/20034“5"“3“0“ 383’ ” [ﬂlliﬂlllﬁlll ”ﬂlllﬂﬂlly Rental Invoice

Equipment J195 West Nime Mile Road DATE INVOICE #
Pensacola FL 32534 04/06/16 | Quote
Rentals & Leases CUSTOMER # SALESMAN
100144 275
CUSTOMER NAME & ADDRESS a
Santa Rosa County Landfill __Yes X No Rental Purchase
6075 Old Bagdad Hwy X Charge  Cash  Payment Terms JOHN DEERE
Milton, FL 32583 X Yes  No Customer to provide physical damage Insurance
PHONE PURCHASE ORDER #
POWERPLAN #
GONTACT  Andrew Hill
QTY | STOCK# A  MODEL DESCRIPTION ' DAY | WEEK MONTH | AMOUNT
1 | ‘250D 25 Ton Off Road Truck - $750.00)  $2,800.00 $8,1OO.OO| $8,100.00
Equipment ;SIII
'Hours
Attachment :SIN
| BILLING SUMMARY
Amount Due . $8,100.00
|
County Santa Rosa County, FL Delivery $125.00
gity  Miton Pick-Up - $125.00
Fuel | $0.00
Insurance
Terms and Conditions of Lease
Beard Equipment Company, as shown above, hereinafter called "Lessor”, hereby leases to the Rental Tax | $0'OO
b d Lessee, hereinafter called "Lessee" ; and hereby | d hires from Lessor, th
cauipment and machinery dscrbed abore efened 0 herelh o "eqipment, upon re s, TOTAL DUE _ $8,350.00

conditions and stipulations as set forth. The equipment, receipt of which in good condition is
hereby acknowledged by Lessee, shall be leased for a period of

1 Month |, beginningonthe 6 day of April
Subject to terms and conditions set forth above.

BEARD EQUIPMENT (LESSOR] Santa Rosa Gounty Landfill (LESSEE)

BY: John Frank By:




TRACTOR & EQUIPMENT
Company

9036 Pine Forest Rd. Pensacola, F1 32534
(850)505-0550 - FAX (850)505-0551

4/7/2016
Santa Rosa County Landfill
Milton, FL

Subject: Off Road Truck Quotation

Thank you for the opportunity to submit the following quotation for your consideration.

One (1) Rental Fleet Komatsu HM300-5 Truck

Machine Monthly Rental Rate:......cmieririemiesieneeersmeenianaenns $8500.00

Estimated delivery charge $900.00 ea way

Thank you again for allowing us to submit this quotation and we look forward to the opportunity to earn your
business now and in the future. Please do not hesitate to contact me at (850)736-2090 or lcook1@tractor-equipment.com,

should you have any questions or.concerns. .
Sincerely,

Larry Cook
Branch Manager

QUOTATIONS SUBJECT TO CHANGE WITHOUT NOTICE- ALL AGREEMENTS CONTINGENT UPON STRIKES, ACCIDENTS AND OTHER
CONDITIONS BEYOND OUR CONTROL - ALL CONTRACTS ARE SUBJECT TO APPROVAL BY AN OFFICER OF THE COMPANY



Andrew Hill

From: Tommy Walker [tommywalker@thompsontractor.com]
Sent: Wednesday, April 06, 2016 12:09 PM

To: Andrew Hill

Subject: Truck Quote Requested

Andrew —

Thompson Tractor has standardized on two sizes of trucks for our rental fleet.

We offer the Caterpillar 725 truck --- with a 20 yd capacity (25 metric ton rated payload)
We have two available now on our Pensacola yard
$8,800 / month rental rate based on three months

We offer the Caterpillar 740B truck — with a 31.4 yd capacity (40 metric ton rated payload)
We have one available now on our Pensacola yard
$12,500 / month rental rate based on three months

If you choose not to transport these yourself, please allow $600 round-trip for delivery/pickup by TTCo trucks

Rates quoted are based on a 28-day billing cycle allowing 176 hours usage per month. Insurance to be
provided by Santa Rosa County.

As always, thanks for the opportunity and let me know how this turns out.

Tommy Walker

Sales Representative — Crestview
850-865-0096 cell

850-682-6510 office
tommywalker@thompsontractor.com

From: Andrew Hill [mailto:AndrewH@santarosa.fl.gov]
Sent: Wednesday, April 06, 2016 11:38 AM

To: Tommy Walker

Subject: RE: Quote Request

30yrd, if you have it on the lot?

From: Tommy Walker [mailto:tommywalker@thompsontractor.com]
Sent: Wednesday, April 06, 2016 11:17 AM

To: Andrew Hill

Subject: Re: Quote Request

What size are you looking for??



