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BUDGET MODIFICATION RESOLUTION

No.
Whereas, the Board of County Commissioners has determined that a need exists to amend the budget pursuant to Florida Statute 129.06.
NOW, THEREFORE, The Board of County Commissioners of Santa Rosa County, Florida does make the following budget amendments:

REQUESTER ACTION DATE: June 14, 2016

FROM: District 5 Recreation Fund ADDITION:

TO: Board of County Commissioners MODIFICATION: X

VIA: Budget Director DELETION:

SUBJ: Request Approval of the following OVERDRAFT:
Lineltem Number Description Amount

From: 2325 —-599001 Reservefor Contingencies ($2,055)
2325 —59100001 To General Fund $ 2,055

To: 001 — 3810003 From District 1V $ 2,055
2600 — 546001 Repair & Maintenance $ 2,055

State reason for thisrequest:

Transfer funds from District V Recreation Fund to Parks department to re-stripe the basketball court, tennis
court, and 4-sguare, hopscotch, and shuffle boards at Swenson Park.

Requested by Tammy Simmons/s/

BUDGET DIRECTOR ACTION DOCUMENT NO. 2016-152
Budget Updated: Allowed: Forwarded: Returned:
Comment:

BUDGET DIRECTOR
BUDGET COMMITTEE ACTION DATE: June 20, 2016
Approved: _ Hold: _ Withdrawn: _ Comment:

PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Board of County Commissioners of Santa Rosa County, Florida on this
23rd day of June, 2016.

ATTESTED:

CHAIRMAN

CLERK OF THE COURTS



Jayne Bell

From: Tammy Simmons

Sent: Tuesday, June 07, 2016 3:56 PM

To: Jayne Bell; Henry Brewton

Cc: Stephen Furman

Subject: FW: Estimate from Coastline Striping: Inc.
Attachments: Est_2671_from_Coastline_Striping_Inc._4120.pdf

Recommend Budget Amendment in the amount of $2,055 transferring funds from District IV Recreation Fund to the
General Fund, Parks Department. This is to re-strip basketball court, tennis court, 4-square, hopscotch, and shuffle
board at Swenson Park.

Tammy C. Simmons

Santa Rosa County Administrative Services Manager
Administrative Services Department

6075 Old Bagdad Hwy.| Milton, Florida 32583

P: 850-983-1858 | F: 850-623-1331

Santarosa.fl.gov | Facebook | Twitter | Instagram

Help us improve our customer service with this short survey.

From: Commissioner Lynchard

Sent: Tuesday, June 07, 2016 3:44 PM

To: Tammy Simmons

Subject: Re: Estimate from Coastline Striping: Inc.

Yes thank you.

Lane Lynchard
Sent from my iPhone

On Jun 7, 2016, at 3:32 PM, Tammy Simmons <TammyS(@santarosa.fl.gov> wrote:

Margaret Cunningham has asked that we re-strip the courts at Swenson Park — would you fund from
recreation funds?

Tammy C. Simmons

Santa Rosa County Administrative Services Manager
Administrative Services Department

6075 Old Bagdad Hwy.| Milton, Florida 32583

P: 850-983-1858 | F: 850-623-1331
Santarosa.fl.gov | Facebook | Twitter | Instagram

Help us improve our customer service with this short survey.

From: Eddie Wease
Sent: Tuesday, June 07, 2016 3:31 PM



To: Tammy Simmons
Subject: Fwd: Estimate from Coastline Striping: Inc.

Sent from my iPhone

Begin forwarded message:

From: Sherry Nims <snims(@ecstriping.com>
Date: June 7, 2016 at 2:08:48 PM CDT

To: Eddie Wease <Eddie W @santarosa.fl.gov>
Subject: Estimate from Coastline Striping: Inc.

Thank you for the opportunity to quote this job for you. Please review the
attached estimate and contact us if you have any questions.

Sincerely,

Sherry Nims

Coastline Striping: Inc.
850-477-4484

Florida has a very broad Public Records Law. Virtually all written communications to or from Santa Rosa County Personnel are public
records available to the public and media upon request. E-mail sent or received on the county system will be considered public and will only
be withheld from disclosure if deemed confidential pursuant to State Law.

<Est 2671 from_Coastline Striping Inc. 4120.pdf>



Coastline Striping, Inc.

Estimate
8840 Fowler Avenue

Pensacola, FL 32534 Date Estimate #

6/2/2016 2671

Name / Address

Santa Rosa County
6075 Old Bagdad Hwy.
Milton, Florida 32583

Project

Swanson Park

ltem Qty Description Rate Total

Tennis/Basketball Court

—

Restripe Tennis Court, Basketball Court, Hopscotch Court & 2055.00 LS 2,055.00
Shuftle Board

This Quotation is Void 30 Days from Date unless Signed and Returned. Thank You for
Considering us! Total $2.055.00
Signature
Phone # Fax #

850-477-4484 850-477-4481




