Tana Tynes
From: Tammy Simmons
et Monday, December 21, 2015 7:33 AM
To: Stephen Furman
Cc: Commissioner Rob Williamson; Daren Thomas (d_thomas@bellsouth.net)
Subject: FW: NYSA Football Scoreboard quote updated
Attachments: : SmartCatalogQuote[1].pdf; FootballScoreboardApprovalletter.doc

item for January 2016 BOCC meeting agenda.
Thanks

Tammy C. Simmons

Santa Rosa County Board of County Commissioners
Administrative Services Manager

6075 Old Bagdad Highway

Milton, FL 32583

850-983-1858 Phone

850-623-1331 Fax

From: Daren Thomas [mailto:darent@spfs.com]

Sent: Thursday, December 17, 2015 6:27 PM

To: Tammy Simmons

Cc: Daren Thomas; Commissioner Rob Williamson
\/’ubjectg_ FW: NYSA Football Scoreboard quote updated

Hi Tammy,

Rob asked me to go ahead and forward this on to you. The NYSA is purchasing a new Football Scoreboard to replace the
old one and we would like for you to coordinate that purchase and delivery to us. We are going through the same
vendor we used when we purchased our baseball scoreboards about 4 years ago. | have attached their updated quote
which includes a $250 shipping discount good through 1/30/16. We are receiving $5,250 from Buffalo Rock/Pepsi which
we are using toward this purchase and then Rob has approved paying for the remainder. We should receive those funds
around mid-January. Rob would like for you to go ahead and put this on the agenda for January.

The NYSA will handle the taking down of the original scoreboard and the installation of the new one. We would then
need you to take away the old one and dispose of it like you did the old basebail ones.

Thanks in advance for your assistance and call ma when you get a moment so we can discuss the sponsor Pepsi going on
a portion of the scoreboard panel.

Thanks,

Daren Thomas

Regional Manager

Southpoint Financial Services, Inc.
“=#143 Navarre Parkway

Navarre, FL 32566



NMLS# 344059

Office: 850-936-0422

Cell: 850-420-6828

Fax: 1-866-311-8280
\r£mail: darent@spfs.com

We may attach a file that will be in an Adobe PDF format. To open and access the file PDF attachment you will need to have the Adobe Reader
software installed on your computer. You may download a free copy of the Adobe Reader software at www.adobe.com.

To access a Free copy of the HUD Settlement Costs Booklet for Homebuyers please click on this link:
http;/mavarremortgage.com/HUD Settlement Costs Booklet-REVISED 1-2010.pdf

This email and and files transmitted with it may contain PRIVILEDGED or CONFIDENTIAL information and may be read or used only by the intended recipient. If
you are not the intended recipient of the email or any of its attachments, please be advised that you have received this email in error and that any use, dissemination,
distribution, forwarding, printing or copying of this email or any of its attached files is strictly prohibited. If you have received it in error, please immediately purge it
and all attachments and notify sender by reply email.

From: Daren Thomas [mailto:d thomas@belisouth.net]

Sent: Thursday, December 17, 2015 3:26 PM

To: 'Commissioner Rob Williamson' <RobWilliamson@santarosa.fl.gov>
Cc: Daren Thomas <darent@spfs.com>

Subject: NYSA Football Scoreboard quote updated

Hi Rob,

Attached is the updated NYSA Football Scoreboard quote where | got the $250 shipping discount extended through end
of January 2016. We are getting funds totaling $5,250 from Buffalo Rock/Pepsi around mid-January that is going toward
this purchase. You agreed to cover the remainder which is $2,391.87, so | wanted to get this to you so you could get it
n the agenda or however you needed to handle it. Let me know if you need anything further on it.

Tammy coordinated this when we purchased our baseball scoreboards about 4 years ago, so | would recommend having
her coordinate this as well. NYSA will handle the taking down of the old scoreboard and installation of the new one
once it is delivered onsite.

Thanks again for all of your support on this!
Thanks,

Daren Thomas
NYSA Board VP
Cell: 850-420-6828

From: Charlene Knight [mailto:CharleneKnight@scoreboardl.com]
Sent: Thursday, December 17, 2015 2:48 PM

To: d _thomas@bellsouth.net

Subject: Varsity Scoreboards

I have attached the quote on the scoreboard.

N’
Thanks,



SANTA ROSA COUNTY
BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS

Administrative Services/Parks Operations

\ JAYER WILLIAMSON, Distriet1 Santa Rosa Public Works Offices Hunter Walker, County Administrator

ROBERT A. “BOB” COLE, District 2 6075 Old Bagdad Highway Roy V. Andrews, County Attorney
W.D. “DON” SALTER, District 3 Milton, FI 32583 Jayne N. Bell, OMB Director

ROB WILLIAMSON, District 4
LANE LYNCHARD, District 5

MEMORANDUM

DATE: December 21, 2015

TO: STEPHEN FURMAN, PUBLIC WORKS DIRECTOR
FROM: TAMMY C. SIMMONS, ADMINISTRATIVE SERVICES MANAGER
RE: NAVARRE SPORTS COMPLEX —- FOOTBALL SCOREBOARD

Recommend budget amendment in the amount of $7,641.87 from District 4 recreation
funds to purchase football scoreboard from Varsity Scoreboards for the Navarre
Sportsplex; Navarre Youth Sports Assaciation will reimburse the county $5,250 from
funds they received from Buffalo Rock/Pepsi after the first of the year.

If you have questions, or need additional information, please contact me.

¢ Tammy Simmons 850-983-1858 ¢ Bethany Parker 850-983-1940 ¢ Fax 850-623-1331 ¢



NIOR

SAVE 33% OR

- BUVING DIRECT!
T 106 Max Hurt Drive o e | o
Murray, Kentucky 42071 ToLL+#E 866-575-0577 u ot at ion
www.varsityscoreboards.com FAX: 270-?59—03945 v L W N 5 ¥ |
Date: 12/17/2015 Customer: NAVARRE YOUTH SPORTS ASSOCIATION
Quote Number: 87053-3 Address:
Prepared By: Charlene Knight NAVARRE FL 32566
Notes:  Discount ends January 30th, 2015 Phone: 8504206828
Fax:
Email: d_thomas @ bellsouth.ngt
Contact: DAREN THOMAS
o : >
VSBX-716R FOOTBALL 6' X 16' 1 $5,295.00]  $5,295.00
BLACK ' ' "IPOWDER COAT BLACK 1 © $0.00 $0.00
White Letter Color ) ‘ White Letters on‘ Scoreboard ’ 1 ' v $0.'00 $0.00
White Trim "~ |White Scoreboard Trim 1 $0.00]  $0.00
VSBX-WC2.4ARTNP ’ LCD WIRELESS NEW PLATFORM 1TX 1RX 1 | s7a500|  $745.00
VSBX-PWRPK4000 INTERNAL BATTERY PACK 1 | $95.00 $95.00
-’ |VSBX-HRN1 " |oUTDOOR HORN KIT ' 1 | s42500]  $425.00
VSBX-PN16 ‘ SPONSOR PANEL 21°X16' 0D NI $525.00]  $525.00
WHITE SPONSOR PANEL WHITE SPONSOR PANEL COLOR 1 | $0.00 $0.00
COLOR ,
Shipping Discount - $250 Shipping Discount - $250 1 ($250.00)|  ($250.00)

Thank you for the opportunity to quote on your project! If you have any questions conce}ning this quotation or if there is
anything else | can do for you, please give me a call.

Sincerely,





