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BUDGET MODIFICATION RESOLUTION
No.

Whereas, the Board of County Commissioners has determined that a need exists to amend the budget pursuant to Florida Statute 129.06.
NOW, THEREFORE, The Board of County Commissioners of Santa Rosa County, Florida does make the following budget amendments:

REQUESTER ACTION DATE: March 16, 2016
FROM: Impact Fee Fund ADDITION:
TO: Board of County Commissioners MODIFICATION: X
VIA: Budget Director DELETION:
SUBIJ: Request Approval of the following OVERDRAFT:
Line Item Number Description Amount
From: 2104 - 5990026 Impact Area 3 Reserves ($ 5,750)
To: 2104 — 5630041 Multi-Purpose Paths 55750

State reason for this request:

Funds the pedestrian crossing across Tom King Bayou at East Bay Blvd. with funding from Area 3 Impact
Foes,

Requested by: Roger Blaylock/s/

BUDGET DIRECTOR ACTION DOCUMENT NO. 2016-122
Budget Updated: Allowed: Forwarded: Returned:
Comment:

BUDGET DIRECTOR
BUDGET COMMITTEE ACTION DATE: March 21, 2016
Approved: Hold: Withdrawn: Comment:

PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Board of County Commissioners of Santa Rosa County, Florida on this
24" day Of March, 2016.

ATTESTED:

CHAIRMAN

CLERK OF THE COURTS



‘Ame rican
‘ CONSULTING American Consulting Professionals, LLC

American Consulting Engineers of Florida, LLC

PLEASE REMIT PAYMENT TO:
American Consulting Engineers of Florida
February 15, 2016 2818 Cypress Ridge Boulevard, Suite 200
Invoice No: 160067 Wesley Chapel, FL 33544
Santa Rosa County Tel 813.435.2600 ~ Fax 813.435.2601
6495 Caroline St billing@acp-fl.com ~ www.acp-fl.com
Ste G
Milton, FL 32570 M
Project 5159866 Tom King Bayou Cost Estimate Development ;{/ 7"] 1,1/1 v
Frofes ‘) 0 '-'l] . b 10 anuan 0, 20106 _ i
Phase 000 Original Agreement
Total Fee 5,750.00
Percent Complete 100.00 Total Earned 5,750.00
Previous Fee Billing 0.00
Current Fee Billing 5,750.00
Total Fee 5,750.00
Total this Task $5,750.00
Total this Phase $5,750.00
TOTAL THIS INVOICE $5,750.00

Thank you for your business!



Jayne Bell

= SRR RS
From: Hunter Walker
Sent: Thursday, December 03, 2015 2:46 PM
To: Chris Phillips
Cec: Michael Schmidt; Tony Gomillion; Shawn Ward; Jayne Bell
Subject: RE: Tom King Bayou

proceed

From: Chris Phillips

Sent: Thursday, December 03, 2015 2:46 PM

To: Hunter Walker <HunterW @santarosa.fl.gov>

Cc: Michael Schmidt <michaels@santarosa.fl.gov>; Tony Gomillion <TonyG@santarosa.fl.gov>; Shawn Ward
<ShawnW @santarosa.fl.gov>; Jayne Bell <JayneB@santarosa.fl.gov>

Subject: RE: Tom King Bayou

Yes sir.

Chris Phillips, P.E.

Project Engineer

Santa Rosa County Engineering
850-981-7100

From: Hunter Walker

Sent: Thursday, December 03, 2015 2:17 PM

To: Chris Phillips <chrisp@santarosa.fl.gov>

Cc: Michael Schmidt <michaels@santarosa.fl.gov>; Tony Gomillion <TonyG@santarosa.fl.gov>; Shawn Ward
<ShawnW @santarosa.fl.gov>; Jayne Bell <JayneB@santarosa.fl.gov>

Subject: RE: Tom King Bayou

Fine with me Chris, | assume we would pay this from impact fee funds since it is for south end pedestrian/bike path.
Hunter

From: Chris Phillips

Sent: Thursday, December 03, 2015 2:15 PM

To: Hunter Walker <HunterW @santarosa.fl.gov>

Cc: Michael Schmidt <michaels@santarosa.fl.gov>; Tony Gomillion <TonyG@santarosa.fl.gov>
Subject: FW: Tom King Bayou

Mr. Walker,

Attached is the fee from American to provide the more in depth services | described in my email this morning. Upon
your OK, | will have Tracy prepare a proposal document for your signature so we can get them started with the analysis.



Chris Phillips, P.E.

Project Engineer

Santa Rosa County Engineering
850-981-7100

-----Original Message-----

From: Boutwell, Tracy D. [mailto:TBoutwell@acp-fl.com]
Sent: Thursday, December 03, 2015 11:30 AM

To: Chris Phillips <chrisp@santarosa.fl.gov>

Subject: RE: Tom King Bayou

Please see the attached revised fee and scope of services. Please feel free to call with any questions.
Thanks,

Tracy D. Boutwell, PE
Principal/Project Manager
American Consulting Professionals
4489 Woodbine Road

Pace, FL 32571

Direct 850-289-1004

Fax 850-289-1001

Cell 850-777-6321

tboutwell@acp-fl.com

From: Chris Phillips [mailto:chrisp@santarosa.fl.gov]
Sent: Wednesday, December 02, 2015 2:24 PM

To: Boutwell, Tracy D.

Subject: FW: Tom King Bayou

Still interested in doing this for us??
Check over the fee and let me know.

Chris Phillips, P.E.

Project Engineer

Santa Rosa County Engineering
850-981-7100

----- Qriginal Message-----

From: Hunter Walker

Sent: Wednesday, December 02, 2015 1:50 PM

To: Chris Phillips <chrisp@santarosa.fl.gov>

Cc: Shawn Ward <ShawnW @santarosa.fl.gov>; Michael Schmidt <michaels@santarosa.fl.gov>
Subject: RE: Tom King Bayou

Thanks Chris. Verify the fee and if same proceed with the proposal.
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Thanks, Hunter

From: Chris Phillips

Sent: Wednesday, December 02, 2015 1:47 PM

To: Hunter Walker <HunterW @santarosa.fl.gov>

Cc: Shawn Ward <ShawnW @santarosa.fl.gov>; Michael Schmidt <michaels@santarosa.fl.gov>
Subject: FW: Tom King Bayou

Mr. Walker,

We had received a price from American Consulting back in March to look at a pedestrian crossing across Tom King Bayou
at East Bay Blvd. My last involvement was that Roger was going to discuss it with you regarding if we should go forward
or not.

| believe Tracy would still honor the proposal sent... certainly we'd check with her again.

We felt it appropriate to have a bridge engineer that has experience in pedestrian bridges provide an appropriate
estimate so we could move forward with applying for FDOT LAP funding to connect the two sidewalks on either side.

Let me know how you'd wish to proceed.

Chris Phillips, P.E.

Project Engineer

Santa Rosa County Engineering
850-581-7100

From: Boutwell, Tracy D. [mailto:TBoutwell@acp-fl.com]
Sent: Friday, March 13, 2015 2:27 PM

To: Chris Phillips <chrisp@santarosa.fl.gov>

Subject: Tom King Bayou

Chris,
Please find attached a letter regarding the scope/fee for the requested project. If you need anything else please let me
know.

Thanks,

Tracy D. Boutwell, PE
Principal/Project Manager
American Consulting Professionals
4489 Woodbine Road

Pace, FL 32571

Direct 850-289-1004

Fax 850-289-1001

Cell 850-777-6321
tboutwell@acp-fl.com




